

To: WISCONSIN CENTRAL GROUP
 C/O WCG - STEERING COMMITTEE
 DEWITT ROSS & STEVENS, S.C.
 2 E. MIFFLIN STREET, SUITE 600
 MADISON, WI 53703

Date: February 8, 2013
 Invoice: 947270
 Client: 71729.000

Re: CANADIAN NATIONAL

To Professional Services		Rate	Hours	Amount
John Duncan Varda				
01-05-13	NO CHARGE - Advisory Board: Exchanges with T. Tisa regarding list of questions	0	0.20	0.00
01-05-13	NO CHARGE - Begin talking points for WMC Executive briefing, re-consider approach and begin reorganization, initial talking points	0	1.20	0.00
01-06-13	NO CHARGE - Receive T. Tisa comments on list of questions; review draft questions; respond	0	0.45	0.00
01-07-13	NO CHARGE - Advisory Board: Respond to C. Smith, Biewer, regarding conference call attendance on 1/23/2013	0	0.15	0.00
01-08-13	NO CHARGE - Email assistant regarding system maps, website correction	0	0.35	0.00
01-08-13	NO CHARGE - Telephone conference from (message) from T. Tisa	0	0.15	0.00
01-08-13	NO CHARGE - Voice-message from T. Tisa regarding meeting setup and list of questions	0	0.15	0.00
01-09-13	NO CHARGE - Advisory Board: Draft and forward suggested agenda for 1/23/2013 meeting; response from T. Tisa	0	0.85	0.00
01-10-13	NO CHARGE - Note from B. Ridley regarding boxcar supply, response; Telephone conference with T. Tisa regarding agenda, questions, speaker phone, etc.; telephone conference from J. Hayrynen	0	0.80	0.00
01-11-13	NO CHARGE - Advisory Board: Draft final agenda; edit list of questions; draft email notice; TCF J. Hayrynen; notes regarding RSVP C. Smith, M. MacPhearson; J. Hayrynen; R. Chavez	0	1.50	0.00
01-11-13	NO CHARGE - New London: research and draft "pilot project prospectus"; forward to J. Culotta for comment	0	1.50	0.00
01-11-13	NO CHARGE - Northwoods Rail: Notice of cancellation of January meeting	0	0.05	0.00
01-11-13	NO CHARGE - Respond to B. Zeitlow regarding wood pellets, review contact information; advice to J. Culotta and T. Tisa regarding potential project	0	0.75	0.00

Date: February 8, 2013
 Invoice: 947270
 Client: 71729.000
 Page: 2

John Duncan Varda				
01-12-13	NO CHARGE - New London: review and update "pilot project prospectus"	0	0.65	0.00
01-14-13	NO CHARGE - Advisory Board: RSVP from M. DePrey and respond	0	0.10	0.00
01-14-13	Circulate update of two "remote" intermodal projects outlines; review note from J. Culotta; forward Pilot Project Prospectus draft to K. Hager at New London	0	0.40	0.00
01-15-13	NO CHARGE - Advisory Board convergence line setup, email T. Tisa; telephone conference with D.J. Aderman regarding RSVP (message); T. Tisa response regarding conference line; T. Tisa response and exchange regarding wood pellett project	0	0.20	0.00
01-15-13	NO CHARGE - New London: Telephone conference with K. Hager (message); telephone conference from K. Hager regarding potential project	0	0.25	0.00
01-15-13	NO CHARGE - PPP New London: Telephone conference with K. Hager regarding outline, background, City's interest, connecting with M. Christopher; review note from J. Culotta regarding same	0	0.70	0.00
01-16-13	NO CHARGE - Advisory Board: REspond to D. J. Aderman regarding alternate; query to T. Tisa regarding same and response; confirm participation by T. Puskamp	0	0.50	0.00
01-17-13	NO CHARGE - Advisory Board: REspond to T. Tisa regarding expected attendees; inquiry to WMC regarding instructions for conference line	0	0.15	0.00
01-17-13	NO CHARGE - Northwoods Rail: Referral from Daryl Landeau	0	0.10	0.00
01-18-13	NO CHARGE - Advisory Board: Advice from T. Tisa regarding CN participants; multiple exchanges regarding event	0	0.70	0.00
01-18-13	NO CHARGE - Email T. Tisa regarding "pilot project approach, New London as example; email M. MacPhearson, Marten, regarding "pilot project" approach, further example regarding Austin/Albert Lea and Waterloo and forward copy of 2011 CN Twin Cities intermodal presentation	0	0.75	0.00
01-19-13	NO CHARGE - Advisory Board: Inquiry to K. Mahlkurch, WMC, regarding verification of call-in instructions	0	0.10	0.00
01-20-13	NO CHARGE - Advisory Board, mark up draft antitrust guidelines (partial)	0	0.65	0.00
01-21-13	NO CHARGE - Advisory Board: Contact WMC regarding call-in number problem and confirm resolution	0	0.25	0.00
01-21-13	NO CHARGE - Rework confidentiality and antitrust guidelines; forward to T. Tisa for comment	0	1.70	0.00
01-22-13	NO CHARGE - Pickup meeting handouts at DeWitt; instructions to assist regarding same	0	0.60	0.00

Date: February 8, 2013
 Invoice: 947270
 Client: 71729.000
 Page: 3

John Duncan Varda				
01-22-13	NO CHARGE - Advisory Board: Travel to Oak Brook, IL	0	3.00	0.00
01-23-13	NO CHARGE - At Oak Brook, attend MARS program (time prorated)	0	1.00	0.00
01-23-13	NO CHARGE - At Oak Brook, attend meeting of CN Advisory Board	0	2.75	0.00
01-23-13	NO CHARGE - Advisory Board: Respond to C. Smith, Biewer, are absence from meeting	0	0.15	0.00
01-24-13	NO CHARGE - At Oak Brook, attend MARS program (time prorated)	0	0.50	0.00
01-24-13	NO CHARGE - At MARS, Oak Brook: contact A. Gould, update on CN Advisory Board; contact P. Kosiol, CN, with A. Gould; with J. Culotta, discussion with L. Ogard regarding Green Bay intermodal event	0	0.50	0.00
01-24-13	NO CHARGE - At Joliet, tour BNSF and UP intermodal facilities, related travel (time prorated)	0	2.00	0.00
01-25-13	NO CHARGE - Travel Chicago to Madison (time prorated)	0	1.00	0.00
01-27-13	NO CHARGE - Advisory Board: Email T. Tisa and K. Levis regarding Committee members, contact information, follow-up	0	0.45	0.00
01-28-13	NO CHARGE - Log Project: Assemble log reports information for B. Zeitlow, CFIRE; email exchanges regarding same	0	0.60	0.00
01-30-13	Further request to J. Culotta regarding Wes Lujan maps link	0	0.10	0.00
01-30-13	NO CHARGE - WEDC Economic Development Conference: Exchanges with M. Purtell regarding acceptance of participation; review agenda and calendar	0	0.50	0.00
01-31-13	Email exchange with E. McKechnie, Watco, regarding status	0	0.20	0.00
01-31-13	NO CHARGE - Advice from T. Tisa regarding contact information and presentations; respond and comment on WEDC presentation	0	0.10	0.00
01-31-13	NO CHARGE - WEDC Development Conference: Provide short bio to M. Purtell	0	0.30	0.00
Total Current Professional Services		0	27.55	0.00

To Disbursements

01-31-13	Advisory Board at Oakbrook, IL allocation of mileage, lodging and meals			200.00
Total Current Disbursements				200.00

Date: February 8, 2013
Invoice: 947270
Client: 71729.000
Page: 4

Total Current Services and Disbursements	<u>200.00</u>
Balance Outstanding on this Matter as of 02-08-13	<u>6,440.25</u>
TOTAL DUE, PLEASE PAY THIS AMOUNT	<u>6,640.25</u>
RE: CANADIAN NATIONAL	

Trust Account Activity for this Invoice

Trust Account Balance as of 02-08-13	13,000.00
Application of Trust to Balance Due on Account	<u>0.00</u>
Balance Remaining in Trust as of 02-08-13	13,000.00